
 
     Building Healthy Wildlife Habitat in the Champlain Valley    
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Date: Thursday, June 18, 2015     Time: 7:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m. 

Location: Lake Champlain Waldorf High School, 122 Bostwick Road, Shelburne, VT  05482 

Guest Speaker: Susan C. Morse of Keeping Track®          

This program is free and open to the public. There will be food and beverages. 
 

 

Co-Sponsored by: 
 

Lewis Creek Association (LCA) 
 

Town Conservation Commissions 
 

Lake Champlain Waldorf High School 
 

Shelburne Farms 
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Spend an evening learning from 
Susan Morse about the wildlife 
habitat that makes the Champlain 
Valley.  This is an invitation to 
hunters, farmers, students, new 
residents, foresters, town 
commissions, town staff, 
teachers, land trusts, residents, 
homemakers, fisherman, artists, 
birders, activists and young 
budding trackers.  Sue will charm 
us with her wit and wisdom about 
people and the natural world. Sue’s 
slide presentation will highlight her 
stunning photography of our local 
resident wildlife and the status of 
our common and most vulnerable 
wildlife species. She will show us 
how to read wildlife sign and 
presence, and how to interpret our 
local landscape for both forest 
health and opportunities for forest     
restoration.  The slide show will be 
followed by an inter-town 
conversation and review of current 
planning maps.  Learn about the 
variety of local habitat types, 
contiguous habitat locations, and 
historic travel corridor 
areas.  Together, we hope to learn 
more about our local wildlife and 
identify inter-town conservation 
priorities for the upcoming years. 
         Keeping Track  
        www.keepingtrack.org 
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         Questions: Contact Marty Illick, LCA, at marty.illick@gmail.com 
 
 


